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Our ref: IG/FOI/24.R.315                                 23 August 2024 
     

Sent via email to:  
 

Dear  

 
Request under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 

 
I write further to your request for information, which was received on 13 

August 2024, to confirm, in accordance with S.1(1)(a) of the Freedom of 
Information Act 2000, that Powys Teaching Health Board (PTHB) does not hold 

the information that you require.   
 

For ease of reference your request is set out below and my response follows.   
 

Your Freedom of Information (FOI) Request:  
I would like to make a FOI request for the following information please. For 

each Trust that referred spinal cord injury (SCI) patients to Welsh Spinal Cord 
Injury Rehabilitation Centre based at the University Hospital, Llandough in 

2023/2024: 

 
1. Overall number of SCI patients referred 

2. Number admitted 
3. Number seen as outpatients 

4. Number inappropriate 
5. Number high tetra 

6. Number low tetra 
7. Number para 

8. Number traumatic 
9. Number non-traumatic  

10. Number adult 
11. Number paediatric. 

 
Powys Response:  

I can confirm Powys Teaching Health Board (PTHB) does not hold the 

information for your above requested as we would not be able to identify which 
Powys patients admitted to Llandough were specifically for spinal cord injury. 



  

This information would be held directly with Cardiff & Vale University Health 

Board, and we recommend you contact them directly for this information via 
the following email:  FOI.Requests@wales.nhs.uk   

 
Under the terms of the Health Board’s Freedom of Information procedure, 

individuals seeking access to recorded information held by the Health Board 
are entitled to request an internal review of the handling of their requests. If 

you would like to complain about the Health Board’s handling of your request, 
please contact us directly at the address below or register your complaint via 

powysfoi.foi@wales.nhs.uk  

If after Internal Review you remain dissatisfied you are also entitled to refer 

the matter to the information commissioner at the Information Commissioner’s 
Office (Wales), 2nd Floor, Churchill House, Churchill Way, Cardiff, CF10 2HH. 

Telephone Number: 0330 414 6421. 

Yours sincerely 
 

Vicki Cooper  
Chief Digital Information Officer 
 

Rydym yn croesawu derbyn gohebiaeth yng Nghymraeg. Byddwn yn ateb y 
fath ohebiaeth yng Nghymraeg ac ni fydd hyn yn arwain at oedi.  

 
We welcome receiving correspondence in Welsh. We will reply to such 

correspondence in Welsh and this will not lead to a delay. 
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