Ffon: 01874 711661

Information Governance Team
Hafren Ward

Q G IG Bwrdd lechyd

0L7o Addysgu Powys Bronllys Hospital
N HS Powys Teaching Bronllys
o Health Board Brecon
Powys LD3 OLY
Email: Powys.FOI@wales.nhs.uk
Tel: 01686 252159/01874 442071

Our ref: IG/FOI/24.R.282 14 August 2024

Sent via email to: G
Dear I

Request under the Freedom of Information Act 2000

I write further to your request for information, which was received on 17 July
2024, to confirm, in accordance with S.1(1)(a) of the Freedom of Information
Act 2000, that Powys Teaching Health Board (PTHB) does hold the information
that you require.

For ease of reference your request is set out below and my response follows.
Your Freedom of Information (FOI) Request:

I would like to request the following information under the Freedom of
Information Act 2000:

1. How many dentists provided NHS services in the health board for each of
the following years (2018, 2019, 2020, 2021, 2022, 2023, 2024)? Could you
please ensure the data is separated by year?

2. How many dentists stopped providing NHS services in the health board for
each of the following years (2018, 2019, 2020, 2021, 2022, 2023, 2024)?
Could you please ensure the data is separated by year?

3. Could you please provide me a list of all NHS dental practices within the
health board?

4. Could you please provide a breakdown of waiting times for each of the
following years (2018, 2019, 2020, 2021, 2022, 2023, 2024)? Could you
please ensure the data is separated by year?

5. How much did patients spend on dental procedures from NHS dentists in the
health board for each of the following years (2018, 2019, 2020, 2021, 2022,
2023, 2024)? Could you please ensure the data is separated by year?

Pencadlys Headquarters
Ty Glasbury, Ysbyty Bronllys, /CYFLOGWR YSTYRIOL Glasbury House, Bronllys Hospital
Aberhonddu, Powys LD3 OLU MINDFUL EMPLOYER Brecon, Powys LD3 OLU

Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth Gymraeg

Bwrdd lechyd Addysgu Powys yw enw gweithredd Bwrdd lechyd Lleol
Addysgu Powys L/ g Powys Teaching Local Health Board

0 Bly,

GAD. I

=

Tel: 01874 711661

. ,:\“‘.""(9 - We welcome correspondence in Welsh
= ' . . .
W;’ §w¢.§ Powys Teaching Health Board is the operational name of



Powys Response:

Please note: Powys Teaching Health Board (PTHB) does not hold this
information in calendar years. Our response to questions 1-5 is based on data
for financial years.

Q1. Please see the tables below for the lists of dentists who provided NHS

services in Powys Teaching Health Board (PTHB) for the years requested.

Financial Year: 2018/2019

Practice Name: Location
Evans Dental Ltd Brecon
Powells Dental Surgery Brecon

My Dentist Brecon

My Dentist Crickhowell
My Dentist Hay-on-Wye
Hay-on-Wye Dental Centre Hay-on-Wye
CrickDental Crickhowell
Ystradgynlais Dental Practice Ystradgynlais
Clovelly Dental Practice Builth Wells
My Dentist Knighton
Orchard Corner Dental Practice Knighton

My Dentist Llandrindod Wells
Charro Dental Rhayader
Deri Dental Practice Llanfair Caereinion
Llanfyllin Dental Practice Llanfyllin
Llanidloes Dental Practice Llanidloes
Llys Einion Dental Practice Machynlleth
Powell Main Dental Surgery Newtown
Clifton Dental Newtown

My Dentist (Troseley House) Newtown

My Dentist (Severnside) Newtown

My Dentist Welshpool
My Dentist / Glan Irfon (HB Managed Practice) Builth Wells
(Practice was taken over by PTHB in 2019/2020)

Machynlleth Managed Practice (HB Managed Practice) | Machynlleth
Financial Year: 2019/2020

Practice Name: Location
Evans Dental Ltd Brecon
Powells Dental Surgery Brecon

My Dentist Brecon

My Dentist Crickhowell
My Dentist Hay-on-Wye
Hay-on-Wye Dental Centre Hay-on-Wye
CrickDental Crickhowell
Ystradgynlais Dental Practice Ystradgynlais
Clovelly Dental Practice Builth Wells
My Dentist Knighton
Orchard Corner Dental Practice Knighton




My Dentist Llandrindod Wells
Charro Dental Rhayader
Deri Dental Practice Llanfair Caereinion
Llanfyllin Dental Practice Llanfyllin
Llanidloes Dental Practice Llanidloes
Llys Einion Dental Practice Machynlleth
Powell Main Dental Surgery Newtown
Clifton Dental Newtown

My Dentist (Troseley House) Newtown

My Dentist (Severnside) Newtown

My Dentist Welshpool
Glan Irfon (HB Managed Practice) Builth Wells
Machynlleth Managed Practice (HB Managed Practice) | Machynlleth
Financial Year: 2020/21

Practice Name: Location
Evans Dental Ltd Brecon
Powells Dental Surgery Brecon

My Dentist Brecon

My Dentist Crickhowell
My Dentist Hay-on-Wye
Hay-on-Wye Dental Centre Hay-on-Wye
CrickDental Crickhowell
Ystradgynlais Dental Practice Ystradgynlais
Clovelly Dental Practice Builth Wells
My Dentist Knighton

My Dentist Llandrindod Wells
Charro Dental Rhayader
Deri Dental Practice Llanfair Caereinion
Llanfyllin Dental Practice Llanfyllin
Llanidloes Dental Practice Llanidloes
Llys Einion Dental Practice Machynlleth
Powell Main Dental Surgery Newtown
Clifton Dental Newtown

My Dentist (Troseley House) Newtown

My Dentist (Severnside) Newtown

My Dentist Welshpool
Glan Irfon (HB Managed Practice) Builth Wells
Machynlleth Managed Practice (HB Managed Practice) | Machynlleth
Financial Year: 2021/22

Practice Name: Location
Evans Dental Ltd Brecon
Powells Dental Surgery Brecon

My Dentist Brecon

My Dentist Crickhowell
My Dentist Hay-on-Wye
Hay-on-Wye Dental Centre Hay-on-Wye
CrickDental Crickhowell




Ystradgynlais Dental Practice

Ystradgynlais

Clovelly Dental Practice Builth Wells

My Dentist Knighton

My Dentist Llandrindod Wells
Charro Dental Rhayader

Deri Dental Practice

Llanfair Caereinion

Llanfyllin Dental/Dental Centre
(Practice relocation during 2021/22)

Llanfyllin/Llansantffraid

Llanidloes Dental Practice Llanidloes
Llys Einion Dental Practice Machynlleth
Powell Main Dental Surgery Newtown
Clifton Dental Newtown
My Dentist (Troseley House) Newtown
My Dentist (Severnside) Newtown
My Dentist Welshpool
Glan Irfon (HB Managed Practice) Builth Wells
Machynlleth Managed Practice (HB Managed Practice) | Machynlleth
Financial Year: 2022/23

Practice Name: Location
Evans Dental Ltd Brecon
Powells Dental Surgery Brecon

My Dentist/Brecon Dental

(Practice changed hands during 2022/23) Brecon

My Dentist Crickhowell
My Dentist Hay-on-Wye
CrickDental Crickhowell
Ystradgynlais Dental Practice Ystradgynlais
Clovelly Dental Practice Builth Wells
My Dentist Knighton

My Dentist/ Little Owl
(Practice changed hands during 2022/23)

Llandrindod Wells

Charro Dental

Rhayader

Deri Dental Practice

Llanfair Caereinion

Dental Centre

Llansantffraid

Llanidloes Dental Practice Llanidloes
Llys Einion Dental Practice Machynlleth
Powell Main Dental Surgery Newtown
Clifton Dental Newtown
My Dentist (Troseley House) Newtown
My Dentist (Severnside) Newtown
My Dentist Welshpool
Glan Irfon (HB Managed Practice) Builth Wells
Machynlleth Managed Practice (HB Managed Practice) | Machynlleth
Financial Year: 2023/24

Practice Name: Location
Evans Dental Ltd * Brecon
Powells Dental Surgery * Brecon




My Dentist * Brecon

My Dentist Crickhowell

My Dentist Hay-on-Wye
CrickDental Crickhowell
Ystradgynlais Dental Practice Ystradgynlais
Clovelly Dental Practice Builth Wells

My Dentist Knighton

My Dentist Llandrindod Wells
Charro Dental Rhayader

Deri Dental Practice

Llanfair Caereinion

Dental Centre

Llansantffraid

Llanidloes Dental Practice Llanidloes
Llys Einion Dental Practice Machynlleth
Clifton Dental Newtown
(New contract holder)

My Dentist (Troseley House) Newtown
My Dentist (Severnside) Newtown
My Dentist Welshpool
Glan Irfon (HB Managed Practice) Builth Wells
Machynlleth Managed Practice (HB Managed Practice) | Machynlleth

* I can confirm these three contracts merged during Quarter 3 of 2023/24.

Financial Year: 2024 /25

Practice Name: Location

Brecon Dental Care Brecon

My Dentist Crickhowell
CrickDental Crickhowell
Ystradgynlais Dental Practice Ystradgynlais
Clovelly Dental Practice Builth Wells

My Dentist Knighton

Little Owl Dental Llandrindod Wells
Charro Dental Rhayader

Deri Dental Practice

Llanfair Caereinion

Dental Centre

Llansantffraid

Llanidloes Dental Practice Llanidloes
Llys Einion Dental Practice Machynlleth
Clifton Dental Newtown
My Dentist (Troseley House) Newtown
My Dentist Welshpool
Glan Irfon (HB Managed Practice) Builth Wells
Machynlleth Managed Practice (HB Managed Practice) | Machynlleth

Q2. Please see the tables below for the list of dentists who stopped providing

NHS services in PTHB during the years requested.

Financial Year: 2018/2019

Practice Name:

Date contract finished:

My Dentist Builth

February 2019




| (Contract immediately taken over by PTHB)

Financial Year: 2019/2020

Practice Name:

Date contract finished:

My Dentist Builth
(Contract immediately taken over by PTHB)

February 2019

Orchard Corner, Knighton

August 2019

Financial Year: 2020/2021

Practice Name:

Date contract finished:

Not Applicable

Not Applicable

Financial Year: 2021/2022

Practice Name:

Date contract finished:

Hay-on-Wye Dental Centre

October 2021

Financial Year: 2022/2023

Practice Name:

Date contract finished:

Powell Main Dental Surgery

August 2022

Clifton Dental

August 2022

Financial Year: 2023/2024

Practice Name:

Date contract finished:

My Dentist Hay-on-Wye

November 2023

Financial Year: 2024/2025

Practice Name:

Date contract finished:

My Dentist Newtown (Severnside)

June 2024

Q3. Please see the table below for the list of dental practices within PTHB.

Practice Name: Location
Brecon Dental Care Brecon
My Dentist Crickhowell
CrickDental Crickhowell
Ystradgynlais Dental Practice Ystradgynlais
Clovelly Dental Practice Builth Wells
My Dentist Knighton
Little Owl Dental Llandrindod Wells
Charro Dental Rhayader

Deri Dental Practice

Llanfair Caereinion

Dental Centre

Llansantffraid

Llanidloes Dental Practice Llanidloes
Llys Einion Dental Practice Machynlleth
Clifton Dental Newtown
My Dentist (Troseley House) Newtown
My Dentist Welshpool
Glan Irfon (HB Managed Practice) Builth Wells
Machynlleth (HB Managed Practice) Machynlleth




Q4. I can confirm PTHB does not hold any data on waiting times for the years
requested. This data is held with the individual dental practice.

Q5. Please see the table below for PTHB patient spend on dental procedures
from NHS dentists in the health board for the years requested. Please note:
our response to this question only relates to paying patients Patient Charge
Revenue (PCR).

2018/19 2019/20 2020/21 2021/22 2022/23 2023/24
M12 M12 M12 M12 M12 M12
Outturn Outturn Outturn Outturn Outturn Outturn
(£'000) (£'000) (£'000) (£'000) (£'000) (£'000)
1,711 1,769 1,730 455 1,047 979

Under the terms of the Health Board’s Freedom of Information procedure,
individuals seeking access to recorded information held by the Health Board
are entitled to request an internal review of the handling of their requests. If
you would like to complain about the Health Board’s handling of your request,
please contact us directly at the address below or register your complaint via
powysfoi.foi@wales.nhs.uk

If after Internal Review you remain dissatisfied you are also entitled to refer
the matter to the information commissioner at the Information Commissioner’s
Office (Wales), 2nd Floor, Churchill House, Churchill Way, Cardiff, CF10 2HH.
Telephone Number: 0330 414 6421.

Yours sincerely

Jayne Lawrence
Assistant Director of Primary Care Service

Rydym yn croesawu derbyn gohebiaeth yng Nghymraeg. Byddwn yn ateb y
fath ohebiaeth yng Nghymraeg ac ni fydd hyn yn arwain at oedi.

We welcome receiving correspondence in Welsh. We will reply to such
correspondence in Welsh and this will not lead to a delay.
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